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Shelley e a mãe foram maltratadas a vida inteira. Elas têm consciência disso, mas não sabem reagir — são
como ratos, estão sempre entocadas e coagidas. Shelley, vítima de um longo período de bullying que
culminou em um violento atentado, não frequenta a escola. Esteve perto da morte, e as cicatrizes em seu
rosto a lembram disso.

Ainda se refazendo do ataque e se recuperando do humilhante divórcio dos pais, ela e a mãe vivem
refugiadas em um chalé afastado da cidade. Confiantes de que o pesadelo acabou, elas enfim se sentem
confortáveis, entre livros, instrumentos musicais e canecas de chocolate quente junto à lareira. Mas, na noite
em que Shelley completa dezesseis anos, um estranho invade a tranquilidade das duas e um sentimento é
despertado na menina. Os acontecimentos que se seguem instauram o caos em tudo o que pensam e sentem
em relação a elas mesmas e ao mundo que sempre as castigou. Até mesmo os ratos têm um limite.

Um romance pronto para ser um clássico. (...) A simplicidade da escrita de Reece tem tanta força que o leitor
demora a suspeitar que possa haver mais em Shelley do que ela realmente nos mostra.The Guardian
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From reader reviews:

Robert Marques:

The particular book Ratos (Portuguese Edition) will bring someone to the new experience of reading the
book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book
very ideal to you. The book Ratos (Portuguese Edition) is much recommended to you to read. You can also
get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Marlon Hood:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your no
cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to attempt look for book, may be the guide untitled Ratos (Portuguese Edition) can be fine book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

Nadine Taylor:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside appear likes.
Maybe you answer might be Ratos (Portuguese Edition) why because the wonderful cover that make you
consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Manuel Porter:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year had been exactly added. This e-book Ratos (Portuguese Edition) was filled in relation to science. Spend
your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has different feel when
they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book.
In the modern era like now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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