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The Waste Isolation Pilot Plant (WIPP), located beneath the desolate flatlands near Carlsbad in southeastern
New Mexico, is the first facility of its kind in the world--the most elaborate and expensive landfill opened to
date that permanently houses mankind's deadliest garbage.

The project is intended to entomb, in a salt formation 2,150 feet underground, four decades' worth of
protective gloves, clothing, and other items contaminated with plutonium and other radioactive materials
used in building nuclear weapons. The nuclear waste--enough to fill more than sixty-five football fields--is
sent to WIPP from U.S. Department of Energy sites in Colorado, Idaho, South Carolina, Washington, and
elsewhere. The plant is regarded both as a coda to the Cold War legacy of weapons production and as a
prototype for future environmental cleanup projects.

Although WIPP has won widespread scientific and political support, it has been a quagmire of conflicting
views about national energy policy. Technical and environmental questions dogged it long before being
built, and debates over its use have continued since its opening in 1999. This book marks the first effort to
trace WIPP's evolution comprehensively and impartially, from its earliest days as the brainchild of a group of
local residents eager to create jobs through two decades of scientific studies, political decisions,
environmental protests, and court challenges. It includes interviews with and character sketches of
politicians, environmentalists, and scientists and explores the lessons that this hotly divisive project can teach
us.
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From reader reviews:

Loretta Faria:

The book Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable considerably more increase. Book
can to become your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you
can make reading a book Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site to
become your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge
about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read a publication Nuclear
Reactions: The Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science guide or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Victor Hubbard:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for us. The book Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of Opening a
Radioactive Waste Disposal Site seemed to be making you to know about other understanding and of course
you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The book Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of
Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site is not only giving you much more new information but also to
get your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book.
Try to make relationship with the book Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste
Disposal Site. You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Dorothy Betancourt:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Nuclear Reactions: The
Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this
book? Let's observe.

Shawn Mathison:

You can obtain this Nuclear Reactions: The Politics of Opening a Radioactive Waste Disposal Site by
browse the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve difficulty if you get
difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by written or printed
but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just
looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to
get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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