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One of the most popular presidents of the twentieth century, John F. Kennedy has been the subject of
countless books, documentaries, and portrayals both on television and in feature films. Whether depicting his
exploits during World War II (PT-109), capturing crucial moments during his presidency (Thirteen Days), or
providing a fictionalized account of his assassination (Executive Action), films continue to portray Kennedy
and his legacy.

In The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama, Raluca Lucia Cimpean examines John F. Kennedy’s
representations in motion pictures, focusing on how the late president’s image has been constructed to keep
the myths of the Kennedy era and Camelot alive. The volume explores those myths through docudramas,
which combine the aesthetic and narrative codes of documentaries with those of fiction to portray the
characters and events of the Kennedy era as classic battles between good and evil. Beginning with an
examination of the docudrama and its uses, this book analyzes the Kennedy image—with its focus on the
New Frontier, Camelot, and revisionist approaches—and then provides in-depth examinations of such films
as JFK, In the Line of Fire, and The Rat Pack.

Drawing on archival research and Kennedy letters only recently released to the public, The JFK Image will
be of great interest to scholars of film and popular culture, as well as those working in political science, the
culture of the 1960s, and, of course, Kennedy studies.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua McIntosh:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important usually. The book The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and History) was
making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The guide The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and History) is not only giving
you more new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your spend time to
read your book. Try to make relationship while using book The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and
History). You never experience lose out for everything should you read some books.

Clark Palumbo:

This The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and History) usually are reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film
and History) can be one of the great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food
but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your prior knowledge. This book will be handy,
you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed versions. Beside
that this The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and History) giving you an enormous of experience
for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day
pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Clement Williams:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying The JFK Image: Profiles in
Docudrama (Film and History) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by reading this book.
Reading practice all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world much better then
how they react towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky
particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for every you who want to
start examining as your good habit, you could pick The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and
History) become your own starter.

Linda Soto:

You may get this The JFK Image: Profiles in Docudrama (Film and History) by check out the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only through written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this
book by e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable



ways for you.
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