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Detective story writer Antonia Darcy and her husband Hugh Payne are asked to travel to Devon in order to
prevent a murder on Sphinx Island, but they are far from enthusiastic as they suspect an elaborate joke. And
when they hear that one of the house party guests is Romaine Garrison-Gore, another crime writer, they have
no doubt that they will walk into a rather tedious variant of the Murder Weekend. After all, it is their tenth
wedding anniversary and Major Payne's aunt, Lady Grylles, has been trying to think of a truly original
present for them... But then they receive a rather sinister letter signed 'The Riddler' and become curious...
could the devil speak true?
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From reader reviews:

Paulette Cantu:

This The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An Antonia Darcy and Major Payne Mystery tend to be reliable for you
who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An
Antonia Darcy and Major Payne Mystery can be among the great books you must have is usually giving you
more than just simple looking at food but feed you actually with information that perhaps will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An Antonia
Darcy and Major Payne Mystery forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving
you demo of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in
reading.

Ashley Downs:

Typically the book The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An Antonia Darcy and Major Payne Mystery has a lot
details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you
can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Steven Kilgore:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An Antonia Darcy and Major
Payne Mystery why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Charles Buffington:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it.
It is referred to as of book The Riddle of Sphinx Island: An Antonia Darcy and Major Payne Mystery. You
can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make an
individual happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.
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