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When the safest place she knows…

The last year of Amber McNair’s life has been a whirlwind of jet-setting back and forth across the country,
smiling for the cameras and speaking on behalf of full-figured women worldwide. While grateful for the
opportunity to become a national foundation’s spokesperson on the growing obsession with body image,
Amber is exhausted and hasn’t had a moment to enjoy herself in far too long. The final leg of the
promotional tour being held on a seven night cruise was a godsend. The sexy guy on the boat that takes her
breath away from the first second she sees him, is a delicious perk; but Amber’s been heartbroken before, so
this time, she’s not so sure she should indulge.

…is in his arms.

Brandon Donovan is at his company’s annual morale-boosting and celebratory event. After years of
attending the boring weekend-long stays at some secluded resort, this time, Brandon finds himself on a
Caribbean cruise. Timing could not be worse for him to be somewhat off the grid, considering what he and
his cousins have just learned about the Senior Donovans, but meeting the charming and beautiful
spokesperson for a national company is refreshing. Spending a sultry and sensual night with her was more
rewarding than he could have ever imagined. Until he learns that she may not be who she says she is and that
her true identity may lead him to the man who claims to be a Donovan.

**AUTHOR'S NOTE: This book is #13 in a series. While it may not be necessary to read each book that has
come before this one, it is highly recommended that HEART OF A DONOVAN, EMBRACED BY A
DONOVAN and WRAPPED IN A DONOVAN be read before reading this book, as there is a continuing
plot in each of these stories.
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From reader reviews:

Bonita Murray:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept In The Arms of a
Donovan: A Sexy BBW Billionaire Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13) suitable to you? The
actual book was written by famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled In The Arms of a
Donovan: A Sexy BBW Billionaire Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13)is one of several books
in which everyone read now. That book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve
you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
so all of people can easily to know the core of this publication. This book will give you a wide range of
information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Robert Bell:

The guide with title In The Arms of a Donovan: A Sexy BBW Billionaire Family Series Romance (The
Donovans Book 13) contains a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage
after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of
the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book
with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Ilene Bixler:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book and also novel and In The Arms of a Donovan: A Sexy BBW Billionaire
Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13) as well as others sources were given expertise for you.
After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve
was created for teacher or even students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their
knowledge. In additional case, beside science reserve, any other book likes In The Arms of a Donovan: A
Sexy BBW Billionaire Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13) to make your spare time
considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Charles Frye:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book In The Arms of a Donovan: A Sexy BBW
Billionaire Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13) to make your current reading is interesting.
Your own personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy
book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about book and studying especially. It is to be first
opinion for you to like to available a book and study it. Beside that the reserve In The Arms of a Donovan: A



Sexy BBW Billionaire Family Series Romance (The Donovans Book 13) can to be your new friend when
you're experience alone and confuse using what must you're doing of their time.
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