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NAMED ONE OF THE BEST BOOKS OF THE YEAR BY KIRKUS REVIEWS

Acclaimed author Elizabeth Moon spins gripping, richly imagined epic fantasy novels that have earned
comparisons to the work of such authors as Robin Hobb and Lois McMaster Bujold. In this volume, Moon’s
brilliant masterwork reaches its triumphant conclusion.
 
The mysterious reappearance of magery throughout the land has been met with suspicion, fear, and violence.
In the kingdom of Lyonya, Kieri, the half-elven, half-human king, struggles to balance the competing
demands of his heritage while fighting a deadly threat to his rule: evil elves linked in some way to the rebirth
of magic.
 
Meanwhile, in the neighboring kingdom of Tsaia, a set of ancient artifacts recovered by the former
mercenary Dorrin Verrakai may hold the answer to the riddle of magery’s return. Thus Dorrin embarks on a
dangerous quest to return these relics of a bygone age to their all-but-mythical place of origin. What she
encounters there will change her in unimaginable ways—and spell doom or salvation for the entire world.

Praise for Crown of Renewal
 
“Mesmerizing . . . [Elizabeth] Moon offers convincingly realized characters persuasively shaped by the
extraordinary richness, depth and texture of the world they inhabit. . . . Such is the allure of an extremely
talented writer at the the height of her powers.”—Kirkus Reviews (starred review)
 
“Elves, demons, warped magicians, ancient artifacts, time travel, and an agrarian-based society make for an
evocative story. . . . The depth of each character’s emotions . . . show the author’s writing power.”—Booklist
 
Praise for Elizabeth Moon
 
Limits of Power
 
“Thoughtful and deeply character driven, full of personal crises as heartbreaking and hopeful as any dramatic
invasion . . . Fantasy fans will be delighted by this impressive foray.”—Publishers Weekly (starred review)
 
Echoes of Betrayal
 
“This is an excellent series, and Echoes of Betrayal is particularly well done. [Moon is a] consistently
entertaining writer, and this book lives up to her standards.”—San Jose Mercury News
 
“Rousing action and intriguing plot twists.”—Kirkus Reviews
 
Kings of the North
 
“Moon’s characters navigate an intricate maze of alliances and rivalries. . . . Close attention to military detail
gives the action convincing intensity.”—The Star-Ledger



 
“Her storytelling is as electrifying as ever, and her readers should be delighted with this new vista of a well-
known world.”—Booklist

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Rita Dubois:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Crown of Renewal
(Legend of Paksenarrion Book 5)? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion
or you have some other opinion?

Brett Baker:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want sense happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The Crown of
Renewal (Legend of Paksenarrion Book 5) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Thomas Lemos:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your free
of charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If
you want to attempt look for book, may be the e-book untitled Crown of Renewal (Legend of Paksenarrion
Book 5) can be fine book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Leon Bailey:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library or even make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
soul or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Crown of Renewal (Legend of Paksenarrion Book 5) can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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