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Phil Camp has a problem. Not the fact that he wrote a parody of a self-help book (Where Can I Stow My
Baggage?) that the world took seriously and that became an international bestseller, or that he wrote the
book under a phony name, Marty Fleck, and the phony name became a self-help guru overnight. Phil cannot
be Marty Fleck. He can barely be himself.

No, Phil's problem is that he has been walking with a limp for nine months. Phil is in constant pain, yet there
is nothing physically wrong with his body that would cause such agony. This problem leads him to the
controversial Dr. Samuel Abrun, a real doctor who wrote a real self-help book (The Power of "Ow!") that
made thousands of people pain-free.

So what happens when the self-help fraud meets the genuine item? Does he get better? Can he hobble out of
his own way to help himself? Most important, can the reader make it through fifty pages without thinking,
Wait a minute. Is that a twinge I feel in my lower back or just gas?

Phil embraces Abrun's unorthodox psychogenic theories passionately but manages to save some passion for
Abrun's daughter, Janet, herself a doctor who has her own theories about, and remedies for, chronic pain. If
all this weren't enough, Phil tries to delve further into his past with his unconventional psychotherapist, the
Irish Shrink, even if it means revealing dark secrets he never remembered telling him the first two or three
times. To top it all off, Phil confronts his alter ego's nemesis, right-wing radio blowhard Jim McManus, only
to find out they share a common enemy -- the same family.

Like Carl Hiassen and Larry David, author Bill Scheft understands that the best humor is always
excruciating. That fits the story of Everything Hurts and its lesson: Pain is the ultimate teacher. By the end,
Phil Camp, the self-proclaimed "self-help fraud," turns out to be the real thing. And the real thing turns out to
be flawed and confused, but hopeful. In other words, human.
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From reader reviews:

Mark McCarver:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Everything Hurts: A Novel
book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Greg Little:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't work here
is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside appear likes.
Maybe you answer could be Everything Hurts: A Novel why because the wonderful cover that make you
consider with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Joseph Kidwell:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for your requirements is Everything Hurts: A Novel this e-book consist a lot of the
information of the condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up.
The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book appropriate all of you.

Thomas Gonzalez:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just resting
on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Everything Hurts: A Novel can be the response, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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