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Cuddle up with a classic! In twelve needle-felted scenes and twelve child-friendly words, each book in this
ingenious series captures the essence of a literary masterpiece. Simple words, sturdy pages, and a beloved
story make these books the perfect vehicle for early learning with an erudite twist. Budding bookworms will
delight in this clever retelling of the classics made just for them!

In E. T. A. Hoffmann's The Nutcracker, marvel at Maria's favorite gift, cheer as she defeats the Mouse King,
and journey to the magical Land of Sweets. It's a festive first words primer for your literary little one!

The Cozy Classics series is the brainchild of two brothers, both dads, who were thinking of ways to teach
words to their very young children. They hit upon the classics as the basis for their infant primers, and the
rest, as they say, is history. From Moby Dick to Pride and Prejudice, here are The Great Books of Western
Literature for toddlers and their parents in ebook form—a little bit serious, a little bit ironic, and entirely
funny and clever. Plus, this is the fixed format version, which looks almost identical to the print edition.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Jennings:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How people have
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Cozy Classics: The
Nutcracker book because this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in this
book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Thomas Abrams:

The experience that you get from Cozy Classics: The Nutcracker is a more deep you rooting the information
that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Cozy Classics: The Nutcracker giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article author
conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by anyone who read this because the author of this
reserve is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it
is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose
you for having this specific Cozy Classics: The Nutcracker instantly.

Paul Howard:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer might be Cozy Classics: The Nutcracker why because the wonderful cover that
make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Keith Lugo:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Cozy Classics: The Nutcracker can be the
solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?
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