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DeadBase VII contains the most complete and accurate listing of Grateful Dead concerts and song lists
known, plus several new features including library research, personal interviews, recordings files of
newspaper clippings, etc.

Deadbase is more than the master list of dates and songs: it is a complex database-management system
capable of performing such functions as identifying all shows where a given song, or grouping of songs, was
played, or analyzing the evolution of patterns of songs played over the years. We have shown several views
for our various chapters.

CONTENTS: Song Lists * Songs Played * Table * Every Time Played * Played/Not Played * Places Played
* Arena Survey * Deadhead Survey * Feedback Results * Tape Timings * Lyrical Images * Reviews *
GaricaBase & WeirBase * Odds & Ends
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From reader reviews:

Megan Fairbanks:

The book Dead Base VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists make one feel enjoy for your
spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book Dead Base
VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists being your habit, you can get more advantages, like
add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are able to know
everything if you like open up and read a book Dead Base VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song
Lists. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how
do you think about this book?

Marcus Laws:

The ability that you get from Dead Base VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists is the more
deep you rooting the information that hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does
not mean that this book is hard to understand but Dead Base VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead
Song Lists giving you joy feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in specific way that can
be understood simply by anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough.
That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this Dead Base
VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists instantly.

Randy Caldera:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a e-book. The book Dead Base VII: the Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists it
is very good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the actual e-
book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this
book offers high quality.

Danny Padilla:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, do you
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Dead Base VII: the



Complete Guide To Grateful Dead Song Lists which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's find.
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