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 "Notes For Leslie: Lessons I Never Told You"

The rare conflict of being born in an American Concentration camp during World War II with all of the
associated stigmas and traditions that fact implies, while trying to capture the "Dream" of success is at the
heart of this unusual and fascinating truly American Story.

T. Roy Nakai shrugged off the shame that could easily have debilitated other sansei immigrants with similar
episodes. His early path was guided by heritage and the collective thoughts of his father's generation who
were at the forefront of isolation-"shikata ga nai"-a phrase often repeated in the camps that means "it cannot
be helped" justified their historically significant plight, while "gaman", the associated word for "to
persevere" did not allow for defeat.

Growing up distinctly Japanese-American in Southern California at the end of the war drove Roy to succeed
in high school and college as both a scholar and athlete, allowing him a profession that provided continued
success with a home and family and burgeoning dental practice.

At the height of his success, his American Dream was fulfilled until a tragedy struck that ended his 25-year
career and drove him to question the nature of success itself. Struggling to re-invent himself proved
formidable; but through gaman he began to see a new beginning. But that was short lived when a second,
more devastating tragedy created the need for professional help.

Through a series of conversations with his therapist and help from his daughter, he accepted the life of
shikata ga nai. In the process, he allows us to feel the life lessons that he imparts through short adages of
wisdom - a wisdom that could only be acquired through the blending of a unique heritage and traditions with
the tragedy and triumph of a full life.
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From reader reviews:

Leona Ferretti:

The book Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean Guide to Life can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Elephant La Mode: An
Epicurean Guide to Life? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim which book can
give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge
or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Elephant
La Mode: An Epicurean Guide to Life has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Gregg Spencer:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean Guide to Life as
your daily resource information.

Sheila Seim:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not seeking Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean
Guide to Life that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book.
Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world much better then
how they react to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start
studying as your good habit, you could pick Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean Guide to Life become your
own personal starter.

Debra Treat:

This Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean Guide to Life is brand-new way for you who has attention to look for
some information since it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge
more you know otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this Elephant La Mode: An Epicurean
Guide to Life can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this book is easy to get
by means of anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the
e-book web form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is
the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are
looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book sort for your better



life and knowledge.
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