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Celebrating 20 Years of Agatha Raisin—Brand-New Bonus Story Included!

Cranky but lovable sleuth Agatha Raisin's detective agency has become so successful that she wants nothing
more than to take quality time for rest and relaxation. But as soon as she begins closing the agency on
weekends, she remembers that when she has plenty of quality time, she doesn't know what to do with it. So it
doesn't take much for the vicar of a nearby village to persuade her to help publicize the church fete---
especially when the fair's organizer, George Selby, turns out to be a gorgeous widower.

Agatha brings out the crowds for the fete, all right, but there's more going on than innocent village fun.
Several of the offerings in the jam-tasting booth turn out to be poisoned, and the festive family event
becomes the scene of two murders.

Along with her young and (much to her dismay) pretty sidekick, Toni, Agatha must uncover the truth behind
the jam tampering, keep the church funds safe from theft, and expose the nasty secrets lurking in the village-
--all while falling for handsome George, who may have secrets of his own.

A Spoonful of Poison is sure to delight fans of the bestselling Agatha Raisin mystery series by M.C. Beaton.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Denzer:

This A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An Agatha Raisin Mystery book is simply not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is
information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a
lot of information you will get. This kind of A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An
Agatha Raisin Mystery without we realize teach the one who examining it become critical in considering and
analyzing. Don't be worry A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An Agatha Raisin
Mystery can bring whenever you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' become full because you
can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19):
An Agatha Raisin Mystery having very good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not really
feel uninterested in reading.

Harry Keller:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha
Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An Agatha Raisin Mystery book because book offers you rich details and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably
know this.

Anne Young:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a publication. The book A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An Agatha Raisin
Mystery it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular
e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to cover but
this book offers high quality.

Charles Parker:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
means, more simple and reachable. This kind of A Spoonful of Poison (Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19):
An Agatha Raisin Mystery can give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have



issue that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing
more than other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let's have A Spoonful of Poison
(Agatha Raisin Mysteries, No. 19): An Agatha Raisin Mystery.
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