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"With this impressive book, Khaled Anatolios takes his place alongside luminaries like R. P. C. Hanson and
Lewis Ayres as one of the most distinguished interpreters of Nicaea and its legacy. Especially important is
his sympathetic interpretation of Athanasius. For anyone who wants to understand Nicene Christianity and
its relevance for today, Anatolios is quite simply indispensable."
--George Hunsinger, Hazel Thompson McCord Professor of Systematic Theology, Princeton Theological
Seminary

"Khaled Anatolios's new book is a welcome addition to the flood of revisionary scholarship on patristic
trinitarian theology in the last twenty years. Anatolios's treatment helps us to see the perennial importance of
the key figures of the fourth and fifth centuries for all of our thought on this central mystery of the Christian
faith. The clarity of his exposition and his constant desire to draw out the consequences of historical
exposition mean that this book will find a treasured place on the bookshelves of theologians and theology
students across the board."
--Lewis Ayres, Bede Professor of Catholic Theology, Durham University

"This volume is a welcome addition to the trinitarian renaissance of the last decades. Transcending the
distinction between 'historical' and 'systematic,' Anatolios guides us through the work of three key fathers--
Athanasius, Gregory of Nyssa, and Augustine. This opens to us the broader coherence of a trinitarian
theology, which touches every aspect of Christian existence under the primacy of Christ, and a clear
theological epistemology. Retrieving the vision of those who gave shape to Nicaea in this way will, I am
sure, bear much fruit and give great shape to Christian vision today."
--John Behr, dean and professor of patristics, St. Vladimir's Orthodox Theological Seminary
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From reader reviews:

William Perez:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what one you should start with. This Retrieving Nicaea: The Development and Meaning of Trinitarian
Doctrine is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you
want and wish in this era.

Chester Grantham:

The guide untitled Retrieving Nicaea: The Development and Meaning of Trinitarian Doctrine is the book that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person.
The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer
was did a lot of investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you
personally is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Retrieving Nicaea: The
Development and Meaning of Trinitarian Doctrine from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free
time.

Salina Rodriguez:

The book untitled Retrieving Nicaea: The Development and Meaning of Trinitarian Doctrine contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous
author. The author brings you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a
nice learn.

Frank Tye:

Beside that Retrieving Nicaea: The Development and Meaning of Trinitarian Doctrine in your phone, it may
give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you
can got here is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow
community. It is good thing to have Retrieving Nicaea: The Development and Meaning of Trinitarian
Doctrine because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you sometimes have book but
you seldom get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want
to miss it? Find this book and also read it from currently!
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