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In this comprehensive analysis of politics and ideology in antebellum South Carolina, Manisha Sinha offers a
provocative new look at the roots of southern separatism and the causes of the Civil War. Challenging works
that portray secession as a fight for white liberty, she argues instead that it was a conservative,
antidemocratic movement to protect and perpetuate racial slavery.

Sinha discusses some of the major sectional crises of the antebellum era--including nullification, the conflict
over the expansion of slavery into western territories, and secession--and offers an important reevaluation of
the movement to reopen the African slave trade in the 1850s. In the process she reveals the central role
played by South Carolina planter politicians in developing proslavery ideology and the use of states' rights
and constitutional theory for the defense of slavery.

Sinha's work underscores the necessity of integrating the history of slavery with the traditional narrative of
southern politics. Only by taking into account the political importance of slavery, she insists, can we arrive at
a complete understanding of southern politics and the enormity of the issues confronting both northerners
and southerners on the eve of the Civil War.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Tarpley:

The book The Counterrevolution of Slavery: Politics and Ideology in Antebellum South Carolina can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we
leave a good thing like a book The Counterrevolution of Slavery: Politics and Ideology in Antebellum South
Carolina? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many facts for
us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take
for that, you may give for each other; you may share all of these. Book The Counterrevolution of Slavery:
Politics and Ideology in Antebellum South Carolina has simple shape however you know: it has great and
large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Grady Long:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be
examine. The Counterrevolution of Slavery: Politics and Ideology in Antebellum South Carolina can be your
answer because it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Rita Lattimore:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you learn a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what kinds of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of
us novel, comics, and soon. The The Counterrevolution of Slavery: Politics and Ideology in Antebellum
South Carolina provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Jeffrey Bumgardner:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This guide The Counterrevolution of Slavery: Politics and Ideology in Antebellum South
Carolina was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book,
you can really feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you
wanted.
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