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The geopolitical significance of the Sahara is becoming painfully clear. Islamist militant groups and
transnational criminal networks are operating in the region's most fragile states, exploiting widespread
corruption, weak government capacity, crushing poverty, and entrenched social and ethnic tensions. The
unrest spills over borders and aggravates protracted regional crises.

This insecurity raises urgent concerns for the broader Sahara and the West. Perilous Desert details the
sources of instability and what can be done to minimize the threat of simmering conflicts.

Leading experts, through comprehensive accounts of the changing landscape, demonstrate how foreign
assistance that relies exclusively on counterterrorism will only exacerbate the problems. Solutions require
understanding and combatting the roots of the Sahara's many challenges.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Bell:

The book Perilous Desert: Insecurity in the Sahara will bring you to the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to read, this book very
acceptable to you. The book Perilous Desert: Insecurity in the Sahara is much recommended to you to read.
You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Terry Matlock:

The book untitled Perilous Desert: Insecurity in the Sahara is the publication that recommended to you to
study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you. The language that author use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of exploration when
write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get
the e-book of Perilous Desert: Insecurity in the Sahara from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free
time.

Mary Diaz:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year seemed to be exactly added. This reserve Perilous Desert: Insecurity in the Sahara was filled regarding
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can really feel
enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Beverly Bell:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And also
you know that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by
book. Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is actually Perilous Desert:
Insecurity in the Sahara.
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