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For over a decade, the Chicago Tribune has run its annual Holiday Cookie Contest, asking readers to submit
recipes that are both unique and meaningful to them. Each recipe is accompanied by a brief description or
story explaining why the cookie is special to the reader and their family. The Chicago Tribune then carefully
considers these essays while choosing the finalists and ultimately publishing the winners in the paper.

Good Eating's Holiday Cookies is a comprehensive collection of the best holiday cookies as curated from
over a decade's worth of reader submissions to the Chicago Tribune. It is an eclectic and delicious mix of
recipes both traditional and modern, representing the diverse cultural makeup and skill sets of Chicago
Tribune readers.

Complete with full-color photography and helpful baking tips, this book brings the friendly, distinctive tone
of the Chicago Tribune home for the holidays. From cookie classics to twists on old standards, such as
Tropical Nuevo Latino Cookies, Dorie's Dark and Stormies, and Grandma Grump's Peanut Butter Drizzles,
Good Eating's Holiday Cookies provides any home baker with a plethora of possibilities for any holiday
party.
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From reader reviews:

Kenisha Perkins:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yep, by
reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than other is high. For
you who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Good Eating's Holiday Cookies: Delicious
Family Recipes for Cookies, Bars, Brownies and More book as basic and daily reading publication. Why,
because this book is greater than just a book.

Dennis Taylor:

This book untitled Good Eating's Holiday Cookies: Delicious Family Recipes for Cookies, Bars, Brownies
and More to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read
this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retailer or you
can order it by means of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to
read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to
past this reserve from your list.

Bradley Cox:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that usually
you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite from that.
One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride on
and with addition details. Even you love Good Eating's Holiday Cookies: Delicious Family Recipes for
Cookies, Bars, Brownies and More, it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to
miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come
on its called reading friends.

Carlton Wood:

Good Eating's Holiday Cookies: Delicious Family Recipes for Cookies, Bars, Brownies and More can be one
of your nice books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has
good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
still delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to put every word into delight
arrangement in writing Good Eating's Holiday Cookies: Delicious Family Recipes for Cookies, Bars,
Brownies and More yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can drawn you into brand-
new stage of crucial pondering.
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