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One of the most famous poets from classical antiquity, Sophocles was one of three important ancient Greek
tragedians, the others being Aeschylus and Euripides. Writing during the 5th century BC, Sophocles created
some one hundred and twenty three plays during his lifetime, of which only seven have survived in their
entirety. Included in this edition are those seven complete plays, as translated by Lewis Campbell and
include the following: Antigone, Aias (Ajax), Oedipus the King, Electra, The Trachinian Maidens (The
Trachiniae), Philoctetes, and Oedipus at Colonus. These classic tragedies are essential reading and their
influence on modern literature and drama is a profound one.
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From reader reviews:

Nydia Kelly:

The book The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) can give more knowledge
and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the great thing like a book The
Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse)? Wide variety you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share
all of these. Book The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) has simple shape
but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by open and read a
reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Evelyn Brown:

This The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) book is not really ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information
inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. That The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) without
we comprehend teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't
become worry The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) can bring whenever
you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse)
having fine arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Carol Ramirez:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read will be The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse).

Homer Holmes:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of news.
Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking
for the The Complete Plays of Sophocles (The Seven Plays in English Verse) when you required it?
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