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Is Brazil part of Latin America, or an island unto itself? As Nossa and Nuestra América: Inter-American
Dialogues demonstrates, this question has been debated by Brazilian and Spanish American intellectuals
alike since the early nineteenth century, though it has received limited scholarly attention and its answer is
less obvious than you might think.This book charts Brazil’s evolving and often conflicted relationship with
the idea of Latin America through a detailed comparative investigation of four crucial Latin American
essayists: Uruguayan critic José Enrique Rodó, Brazilian writer-diplomat Joaquim Nabuco, Mexican
humanist Alfonso Reyes, and Sérgio Buarque de Holanda, one of Brazil’s preeminent historians. While these
writers are canonical figures in their respective national literary traditions, their thoughts on
Brazilian–Spanish American relations are seldom investigated, and they are rarely approached from a
comparative perspective. In Nossa and Nuestra América, Newcomb traces the development of two parallel
essayistic traditions: Spanish American continentalist discourse and Brazil’s solidly national exegetic
tradition. With these essayistic traditions in mind, he argues that Brazil plays a necessary—and necessarily
problematic—role in the intellectual construction of “Latin America.” Further, in traversing the Luso-
Hispanic frontier and bringing four of Latin America’s preeminent thinkers into critical dialogue, Newcomb
calls for a truly comparative approach to Luso-Brazilian and Spanish American literary and cultural studies.
Nossa and Nuestra América will be of interest to scholars and students of Latin American and Luso-
Brazilian literature and ideas, and to anyone interested in rethinking comparative approaches to literary texts
written in Portuguese and Spanish.
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From reader reviews:

Mitchell Smith:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information especially this Nossa and Nuestra América: Inter-
American Dialogues (Purdue Studies in Romance Literatures) book since this book offers you rich
information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt
in it you probably know this.

Janice Wilham:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading routine give you lot
of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense happy read one having
theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The Nossa and Nuestra América: Inter-American Dialogues
(Purdue Studies in Romance Literatures) is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Larry Devries:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book and so.
There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Nossa and Nuestra América: Inter-American Dialogues (Purdue Studies in Romance Literatures), you are
able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones,
make them reading a guide.

Sharon Bradley:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication Nossa and Nuestra América: Inter-American Dialogues (Purdue Studies
in Romance Literatures) was filled about science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your
research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big
advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get



book that you just wanted.
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